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INTRODUCTION 
Violence against women is a problem having different manifestations 
and it is considered to be very sensitive social issue and much rooted in 
the society of Bangladesh.1 Violence against women (VAW) in the 
forms of physical, sexual and psychological, remains common in the 
lives of Bangladeshi women which seriously affect their physical and 
psychological health.2 The women victims require immediate 
psychological support to reintegrate into society with dignity. Post 
traumatic stress disorder, suicidal tendency, fear and loss of confidence 
are also among other psychological crisis faced by these women.3 A 
survivor of domestic violence often requires medical attention during 
the crisis period. The lives of women are not secured in the society.4 In 
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at  p.5; Jahan, Roushan and Islam, Mahmuda,  Violence Against Women in 
Bangladesh: Analysis and Action, Women for Women and South Asian 
Association for Women Studies, Dhaka, 1997, at p. 62. 
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addition, victim also needs protection, safe accommodation, support, 
counseling and legal assistance. Comprehensive assistance requires not 
only medical personnel, but also counselors, social workers, legal aid 
providers and the police.5 It emphasizes the need to establish a 
sustainable counseling, medicare and legal aid for women victims. 
Government of Bangladesh have provided specialised services for 
women in one-stop crisis centers. Here, survivors of domestic violence, 
incest and rape receive medical, psychological and social support from 
health personnel trained to be compassionate to women's suffering and 
sensitive to the need to change gender power relations.6 An important 
step towards reintegration and normalization of the lives of women 
victims is to take the legal cases to a final decision.7 The Ministry of 
Women and Children Affairs of Bangladesh under the Multi-Sectoral 
Programme on Violence Against Women8 has established Six One Stop Crisis 
Centers (OCC) for victims of violence that provides medical, legal and 
social services to the victims in the six divisional government hospitals. 
This concept has been derived from Malayasia.9 The OCC aims at 
providing essential medical services and legal supports to the oppressed 
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women of the society as well as their rehabilitation.10 It is a joint effort 
of five ministries11 lead by the Ministry of Women & Children Affairs 
and is a collaborative initiative between the Government and NGOs. It 
provides the women and children a package support of medical 
treatment, legal aid, psychosocial counseling and if necessary safe 
shelter.12 The service of OCC has been proved as a very effective 
initiative but it is only a project of Bangladesh government; it needs to 
be established on a permanent basis so that more sustainable thought or 
instrument for long lasting solution is forthcoming. From the formation 
of OCC, it faces different challenges and weaknesses, which affect 
victim’s rights under its framework. The purpose of this study is to 
disclose the general pattern of the one stop crisis center (OCC) and to 
describe it’s existing situation in Bangladesh on legal courses along with 
its strength and weaknesses in relation to women victims of violence. 
This article has been mostly developed from an interview in August 
2010 to September 2010 at Rajshahi Court of 14 women victims who 
took admission in Rajshahi OCC prior to their administering of criminal 
cases at the mentioned Court.13 

FORMATION OF THE ONE STOP CRISIS CENTRE (OCC) 
The OCC is a part of the multi-sectoral programme of the government 
on violence against women and children. It is based on the concept of 
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